
 

 

CONNECTION 

 

 

 
 
573-386-2241                      211 S Main St. Auxvasse, MO 65231                 KINGDOMTELCO.COM  

INTRODUCING KINGDOM NETWORKS

—ONE NAME, ONE MISSION, ONE 

COOPERATIVE FAMILY 

Seventy years ago our founders stretched 
party-line copper across Callaway County 
with a simple goal: make sure rural neighbors 
could hear one another’s voices. That spirit of 
connection has guided every upgrade we 
have made since, from rotary dials to multi-
gigabit fiber. Today that same cooperative is 
turning a new page by bringing all of its 
services—and all of its customers—under a 
single banner: Kingdom Networks. 

For longtime members, the Kingdom name is 
a badge of trust. For newer neighbors in 
towns we reached out as Phynx Fiber as a 
symbol of reliable, locally run broadband. 
Behind both logos, though, has always stood 
the same board of directors, the same local 
team, and the same 24/7 commitment to 
first-class service. Unifying those identities 
lets us speak with one voice while keeping 
every promise you already count on—same 
great team, same reliable service, same 
devotion to our subscribers. 

Why change now? After nearly a decade of 
operating separate brands, we realized we 
were spending too much energy explaining 
that Kingdom and Phynx were really the same 

company. Every duplicated brochure and 
website update took time and energy we 
could be investing in fiber construction. By 
streamlining our public face we can direct 
more resources toward building new routes, 
upgrading speeds, and answering your calls 
on the second ring. 

 

The new era starts close to home. Over the 
next few weeks watch for newly wrapped 
service vehicles and fresh signage at our 
Auxvasse headquarters, 211 S. Main Street. 
You will also see the soft launch of 
KingdomNetworks.com, a redesigned 
customer portal that service maps, account 
tools, and self-service speed upgrades a 
single click away. When the portal goes live 
later this month, it will replace the separate 
KingdomTelco.com and PhynxFiber.com 
sites—so be sure to bookmark it.  
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What will never change is the way you reach 
us. Our local team still answers 573-386-
2241 Monday through Friday, and our 
technicians still roll from the same shop 
when an outage alert pings after midnight. If 
you prefer email, drop a note to 
info@kingdomtelco.com—you will hear back 
from a neighbor, not a bot. 

Thank you for welcoming Kingdom Networks 
with the same warmth you have always 
shown Kingdom Telephone and Phynx Fiber. 
Your support powers every mile of fiber we 
bury and every innovation we adopt. We 
cannot wait to show you what comes next.  

RECONNECT 3 UPDATE 

If the new brand is the headline, our 
Reconnect 3 grant project is the action story 
unfolding just outside kitchen windows. 
Crews have been hard at work in 
Fiberhood R6, a 21-square-mile patchwork of 
farms and homes north of Mexico. Splicing is 
under way, cabinets are humming, and 
barring any late-spring thunderstorms we 
expect the very first homes to go live the first 
week of June.  

Hot on R6’s heels comes Fiberhood R3, 
fanning out north of Thompson. Construction 
there is running on schedule, and we’re 

penciling in late June for the inaugural 
speed-test celebrations. Early sign-ups let 
our planners map every drop in advance, so 
service can flow the same day the last fibers 
are fused.  

 

And here’s the part locals like best: the drop 
to their home is on us—no matter how 
winding the driveway, how long the lane, or 
how many cattle guards we cross to reach 
the gate. Kingdom Networks will lay 
state-of-the-art fiber from the road straight to 
the doorstep at absolutely no cost.  

Warm Regards, 

 

Caleb Pashia  

CEO/General Manager  


